P20-10, Band

vendor pool for band
instruments

vendor pool for band
instruments

requirements published in the
RFP.

SqUTpmE! Ponce De Leon Music
Award Summary Ken Stanton Music Sweetwater Sound Music & Arts
. Center
Max Points
Available:100
Criteria / Points Available
Non Cost:
30 Points Available 26 30 N/A N/A
(See Non-Cost Tab For
Breakdown)
Cost:
70 Points Available 70 51.9 N/A N/A
(See Cost Evaluation Tab For
Breakdown)
TOTAL 96 81.9 N/A N/A
Awarded contract under Awarded contract under VG el con5|de_red els Vendor was deemed non-
- . - . award for not meeting the . s
Notes P20-10 to be included in our | P20-10 to be included in our minimum mandatory responsive for omiting
several documents required

for RFP evaluation.




P20-10, Band Equipment
Non-Cost Evaluation
Max Points Available: 30

Ponce De Leon Music
Center

Ken Stanton Music

Sweetwater Sound

Music & Arts

Criteria / Points Available

Contractor
Qualifications -

Sections 1-3
Points Available: 10

Excellent= 100%

Excellent= 100%

Vendor not considered for
award for not meeting the

minimum mandatory
requirements published in

Vendor was deemed non-
responsive for omiting
several documents required

Points Available: 20

the REP. for RFP evaluation.
Evaluation Notes
Points Awarded 10.00 10.00 N/A N/A
Vendor not considered for
SCOpe of Work award for not meeting the vendor was deemed non-
Section 4 Go0d=80% Excellent= 100%

minimum mandatory
requirements published in

responsive for omiting
several documents required

the REP. for RFP evaluation.
. Lack of detail in response for
Evaluation Notes sections 4.7, 4.8, and 4.9
Points Awarded 16.00 20.00 N/A N/A
Total Non Cost Score 26.00 30.00 N/A N/A

Notes: Non-|
Cost Determined Utilizing Scoring
Matrix Relative to Points Available:

Excellent=100%, Very Good= 90%,

Good=80%, Adequate=70%,
Marginal=50%, Poor=25%,

Unacceptable=0%




P20-10, Band Instruments

Cost Evaluation Ponce De Leon Music Ken Stanton Music Sweetwater Sound Music & Arts
Max Points Available:70
Criteria/ Points Available
Total Items Low
Points Available: 15 112 101 N/A N/A
Points Awarded 15.00 13.50 N/A N/A
Total Items Low On
Like ltems 100 9
Points Available: 15
Points Awarded 15.00 1.40 N/A N/A
Total Bid Cost On Like ltems $234,421.93 $256,887.23 N/A N/A
Points Available: 40
Points Awarded 40.00 37.00 N/A N/A
Total Points Earned For Cost 70.00 51.90 N/A N/A

Notes:

Cost Evaluation Formula:
(Lowest Price/R-where “R” represents
the cost of proposal currently being
ranked) x Points = Score)




RFP P20-10, Band Equipment Bid Form Ponce dceel;fgrn Music Ken Stanton Music
INSTRUMENT Unit Cost Unit Cost
PICCOLO
Burkhart Resona NO BID NO BID
Gemeinhardt 4S Series Piccolo $1,029.00 NO BID
Gemeinhardt KG Limited Professional Piccolo NO BID NO BID
Gemeinhardt Roy Seaman Signature Piccolo $1,679.00 NO BID
Gemeinhardt Roy Seaman Storm Piccolo $899.00 NO BID
Pearl Flutes PFP-165 Grenaditte Piccolo $992.25 $992.25
Yamaha - YPC-81 NO BID $2,623.00
Yamaha YPC-82 NO BID $2,865.00
Yamaha YPC-32 NO BID $600.00
Yamaha YPC-62 NO BID $1,562.00
OBOE
Fox Renard Model 330 Oboe $3,360.00 $3,772.00
Fox Reneard Model 333 Protege $2,660.00 $2,994.00
Loree - Royal Oboe "cR+3" Full conservatory plateau system NO BID NO BID
Loree Paris Professional NO BID NO BID
Selmer Model 121 Intermediate $2,498.35 $2,498.35
Selmer Model 123FB $1,773.55 $1,773.55
Yamaha 441 Intermediate Grenadilla NO BID $2,813.00
Yamaha 841 NO BID $5,382.00
Yamaha YOB 241 Series Student NO BID $1,425.00
ENGLISH HORN
Fox Model 500 English Horn $6,660.00 $7,438.00




Fox Renard Model 555 English Horn $5,040.00 $5,638.00
Loree - English Horn "i+3" Full conversatory System NO BID NO BID
BASSOON

Fox 41 $4,592.00 $5,213.00
Fox Model IV $5,243.00 $5,936.00
Fox Renard Model 220 Bassoon $7,560.00 $8,477.00
Fox Renard Model 51 $4,340.00 $4,933.00
Moosmann M24 Advanced Student Bassoon NO BID NO BID
Schreiber Model S16 Intermediate Bassoon $7,177.00 NO BID
Selmer Bassoon Model 132 $5,109.32 $5,109.32
Selmer Bassoon Model 1432B $3,878.71 $3,878.71
Bb SOPRANO CLARINET

Buffet Crampon E12 Intermediate $1,104.00 NO BID
Yamaha YCL-450NM NO BID $901.00
Backun Beta Bb Silver Keys $904.00 $1,004.00
Selmer Paris B16 Prolouge $1,499.00 $1,499.00
Buffet Crampon Premium Student Bb Clarinet $429.00 NO BID
Eb SOPRANO CLARINET

Buffet Crampon R11 Eb w/ Silver Keys $1,881.00 NO BID
Buffet Crampon R13 Professional Eb w/ Silver Keys $4,470.00 NO BID
Yamaha YCL- 681 NO BID $3,257.00
Bb BASS CLARINET

Buffet Crampon 1180 Student Bass Clarinet $4,798.00 NO BID
Buffet Crampon 1193 Prestige Low C Bass Clarinet $10,214.00 NO BID
Jupiter JBC1000N $1,395.47 $1,427.58
Selmer 1430LP $1,695.04 $1,695.04




Selmer Paris Model 67 Professional $11,722.31 $11,722.31
Yamaha YCL-221 NO BID $1,787.00
Yamaha YCL-621 Low Eb Professional Bass Clarinet NO BID $6,485.00
Yamaha YCL-6221 Low C Professional Bass Clarinet NO BID $7,379.00
EEb CONTRA ALTO CLARINET

Leblanc Model 7181 $2,749.67 $2,749.67
Selmer Paris Model 40 EEb Contra Alto $16,260.35 $16,260.35
Selmer Bundy 1440 NO BID NO BID
BBb CONTRA BASS CLARINET

Vito 7182 BBb Contra Bass Clarinet NO BID NO BID
LeBlanc L7182 BBb Contra Bass Clarinet $4,360.19 $4,360.19
LeBlanc L7181 BBb Contra Bass Clarinet NO BID $2,749.67
SOPRANO SAX

Selmer SS280R $1,299.00 $1,299.00
Yamaha YSS475 I NO BID $1,839.00
Jupiter JSS 1100 $1,119.45 $1,540.98
Yamaha - YSS-875EX NO BID $3,859.00
TENOR SAX

Jupiter JTS 1100 $1,574.72 $1,528.38
Jupiter JTS-700A $969.15 $969.15
Selmer STS280R $1,645.62 $1,645.62
Selmer TS-44 $1,986.36 $1,986.36
Yamaha - YTS 875EX NO BID $3,772.00
Yamaha YTS-480 NO BID $2,067.00
Yamaha YTS-52 NO BID NO BID
Yamaha YTS-62l1I NO BID $2,469.00




Yamaha YTS-26 Standard Tenor Saxophone NO BID $1,349.00
Selmer 1430 NO BID NO BID
BARITONE SAX

Eastman EBS640 Professional Baritone Saxophone $3,368.17 $3,614.00
Jupiter JBS 1100 $3,420.21 $3,472.98
Selmer BS400 Baritone Saxophone $3,393.00 $3,393.00
Selmer BS500 Baritone Saxophone NO BID NO BID
Selmer SBS280R $4,036.68 $4,036.68
Yamaha YBS-52 Intermediate Baritone Saxophone NO BID $4,321.00
Yamaha YBS-62 Professional Baritone Sax NO BID $6,998.00
Yanagisawa BWO01 Baritone Saxophone $5,193.72 $5,193.72
FLUGELHORN

Yamaha YFH-8315G Series Bb - Lacquer NO BID $2,162.00
Yamaha YFH-8315GS Series Bb - Silver NO BID $2,262.00
Yamaha YFH-8310Z Custom Z Series Bb -Lacquer NO BID $2,083.00
Yamaha YFH-8310ZS Custom Z Series Bb -Silver NO BID $2,183.00
Yamaha YFH-631G Series Bb NO BID $1,469.00
Bach 183 Stradivarius Series BB 183 - Lacquer $2,195.98 $2,195.98
Bach 183 Stradivarius Series BB 183S - Silver NO BID NO BID
Bach FH600 Aristocrat Series Bb - Lacquer $814.42 $814.42
Eastman EFG421 - Lacquer $450.50 $483.00
Eastman EFG421S - Silver $542.51 $581.00
Eastman EFG512 - Lacquer $520.47 $557.00
Eastman EFG512 - Silver $613.44 $657.00
Jupiter 1100 Performance Series JFH1100R - Lacquered, Rose Brass $724.98 $860.58




Jupiter 1100 Performance Series JFH1100RS - Silver-Plated Rose Brass $828.04 $948.78
TRUMPET

Adams - MT1S Marching - Silver $933.75 $1,026.00
Adams - MT1 Marching - Lacquer $897.75 $986.00
Bach TR200S Silver $1,299.00 $1,299.00
Bach TR200 Lacquer $1,249.00 $1,249.00
Bach TR300H Silver $551.28 $551.28
Bach TR300H2 Brass $471.28 $471.28
Bach TR600 Brass $343.70 $343.70
Bach TR500S Silver $423.70 $423.70
Jupiter JTR710 Pocket - Lacquer $326.37 $516.18
Jupiter JTR710S Pocket - Silver $375.69 $621.18
Jupiter JTR 1100Q - Brass NO BID NO BID
Jupiter JTR 1100SQ - Silver $868.98 NO BID
Jupiter JTR 1110RQ - Brass NO BID NO BID
Jupiter JTR 1110SQ - Silver $864.76 NO BID
King 2055T Silver Flair - Trigger $929.00 $929.00
King 2055T Silver Flair - Saddle $899.00 $899.00
King 601SP Bb Trumpet- Silver $551.28 $551.28
King 601 Bb Trumpet - Brass $471.28 $471.28
Yamaha - YTR-2330 Silver NO BID $671.00
Yamaha - YTR-2330 Brass NO BID $591.00
Yamaha YTR 4335GlI - Brass NO BID $1,041.00
Yamaha YTR 4335Gl! - Silver NO BID $1,141.00




Yamaha YTR 5330MRC NO BID $1,141.00
Eastman ETR520 - Brass Bell $547.30 $586.00
Eastman ETR520 - Gold Trim $580.85 $622.00
Eastman ETR420 $323.97 $347.00
Eastman ETR221 $323.97 $347.00
Eastman ETR824R $956.58 $1,003.00
F HORN

Conn CONNstellation 8D Series $3,678.07 $3,678.07
Holton 379 $2,597.36 $2,597.36
Holton H179 Farkas Series Fixed Bell $3,571.07 $3,571.07
Holton H181 $3,571.07 $3,571.07
Jupiter 1100 Series JHR1100 - Fixed Bell $1,941.06 $2,313.78
Jupiter 1100 Series JHR1100D-Detachable Bell $2,144.75 $2,456.58
Jupiter 1100 Series JHR1110 - Fixed Bell $1,941.06 $2,313.78
Jupiter 1100 Series JHR1110D - Detachable Bell $2,144.75 $2,456.58
Yamaha YHR-668NII NO BID $3,642.00
Yamaha YHR-567 - Fixed Bell NO BID $2,373.00
Yamaha YHR-567D - Detachable Bell NO BID $2,557.00
Yamaha YHR-671 - Fixed Bell NO BID $3,642.00
Yamaha YHR-671D - Detachable Bell NO BID $3,871.00
Yamaha YHR-567 - Fixed Bell NO BID $2,373.00
Yamaha YHR-567D - Detachable Bell NO BID $2,557.00
Eastman EFH463 $1,332.32 $1,432.00
Eastman EFH462 $1,332.32 $1,432.00




Eastman EFHBRVO $2,048.22 NO BID

Eastman EFH683 - Fixed Bell $1,962.05 $2,115.00
Eastman EFH683D - Detachable Bell $2,146.08 $2,280.00
Eastman EFH682 - Fixed Bell $1,962.05 $2,114.00
Eastman EFH682D - Detachable Bell $2,146.08 $2,280.00
Eastman EFH884 - Fixed Bell $2,631.08 $2,823.00
Eastman EFH884D - Detachable Bell $2,864.96 $3,059.00
MELLOPHONE

Yamaha YMP 204 - Silver NO BID $1,352.00
Yamaha YMP 204 - Lacquer NO BID $1,240.00
Jupiter JIMP1101M - Lacquer $1,091.73 $1,174.50
Jupiter IMP1101MN - Nickel NO BID NO BID

Jupiter IMP1101MS - Silver $1,253.78 $1,349.50
Jupiter JBR1101MS - Silver NO BID $1,854.50
Jupiter JBR1101M - Lacquer NO BID $1,654.50
Jupiter JBR1101MN - Nickel NO BID NO BID

Adams MM1S - Silver $1,269.00 $1,269.00
Adams MML1 - Lacquer $1,185.75 $1,185.75
Eastman EMP304S - Silver $859.77 $804.83

Eastman EMP304 - Lacquer $637.40 $623.43

TROMBONE

Yamaha YSL 445 NO BID $1,059.00
Yamaha YSL 447G NO BID $1,059.00
Bach Model 12 $2,252.42 $2,252.42
Bach TB301 $471.28 $471.28




Bach Model 16 $2,252.42 $2,252.42
Eastman ETB221 $323.97 $347.00
Jupiter JTB1100 $645.50 $801.78
Jupiter JTB1101R NO BID NO BID
King 606 $471.28 $471.28
F-ATTACHMENT TROMBONE

Yamaha YSL-448G NO BID $1,343.00
Yamaha YSL-446G NO BID $1,343.00
Yamaha YSL-GOAL NO BID NO BID
Bach TB200B $1,271.73 $987.00
Bach 42AF $3,189.45 $3,189.45
Bach 42B $2,631.30 $2,631.30
Bach 42BO - Rose Bell $2,631.30 $2,631.30
Conn 52H Artist Series $1,146.76 $1,146.76
Eastman ETB420 $578.93 $621.00
Eastman ETB428 $623.03 $669.00
Eastman ETB528 $786.93 $844.00
Eastman ETB828 $1,400.37 $1,440.00
Jupiter JTB1100F $864.40 $1,003.38
Jupiter JTB1100RF NO BID NO BID
King 608F $1,146.76 $1,146.76
BASS TROMBONE

Bach 50A $4,627.96 $4,627.96
Bach 50B $2,908.59 $2,908.59
Bach 50B2 $3,636.44 $3,636.44




Bach 50B2L $3,714.43 $3,714.43
Bach 50BO $2,908.59 $2,908.59
Yamaha YBL-421G NO BID $2,108.00
Yamaha YBL 620-G NO BID $3,081.00
Yamaha YBL-822G NO BID $3,967.00
Yamaha YBL 830 NO BID $3,764.00
Jupiter JTB1180 $2,055.22 $1,918.98
Jupiter JTB1180R NO BID $2,002.98
Conn 110H $2,076.39 $2,076.39
Conn 112H $2,985.54 $2,985.54
Shires TBQ36R $2,295.00 NO BID

Shires T36YA $2,655.00 NO BID

Eastman ETB848 $1,914.12 $1,954.00
EUPHOMIUM

Besson BE1065 $2,090.00 NO BID

Eastman EEP 526 $2,375.16 $2,525.00
Eastman EEP421 $909.62 $968.00

Eastman EEP426 $1,119.53 $1,189.00
Holton B490R $1,714.59 $1,714.59
Holton B490RS $1,985.73 $1,985.73
Jupiter JEP1000 $1,274.04 $1,404.50
Jupiter JEP1000S $1,553.52 $1,649.50
Jupiter JEP1020 $1,463.08 $1,599.50
Jupiter JEP1020S $1,713.64 $1,844.50




King 2280 $1,853.12 $1,853.12
King 2280SP $2,087.25 $2,087.25
Yamaha YEP 642lI NO BID $4,939.00
Yamaha YEP 642SI| NO BID $5,142.00
Yamaha YEP-321 NO BID $1,793.00
Yamaha YEP-321S NO BID $2,022.00
MARCHING BARITONE

Yamaha YEP-202M NO BID $2,142.00
Yamaha YEP-202MS NO BID $2,323.00
Yamaha YBH-301M NO BID $1,709.00
Yamaha YBH-301MS NO BID $1,895.00
Adams MB1 Series Marching Bb Baritone Silver $1,588.50 $1,680.75
King K30 $2,069.39 $2,069.39
King K30SP $2,299.32 $2,299.32
King 1127 $1,793.96 $1,793.96
King 1127SP $1,965.56 $1,965.56
Jupiter JBR1101M $1,015.37 $1,654.50
Jupiter JBR1101MN NO BID NO BID
Eastman EM411 $831.98 $894.00
Eastman EM411S $1,068.73 $1,103.00
CONCERT TUBA WITH CASE

Yamaha YBB-641 NO BID $6,301.00
Yamaha YBB-621 NO BID $6,367.00
Yamaha YBB-321 NO BID $4,731.00
Yamaha YBB-321S NO BID $5,026.00




Yamaha YBB 105 NO BID $2,823.00
St. Petersburg 202 NO BID $4,399.99
St Petersburg 203/450 NO BID $4,399.99
Miraphone 282 NO BID NO BID

Miraphone 186-4U NO BID $10,299.99
Meinl Weston 25 $8,484.00 NO BID

King 1135-W $3,686.43 $3,686.43
Jupiter JTU700 $2,081.91 $2,299.70
Jupiter JTU700S NO BID NO BID

Jupiter JTU1110 $4,117.44 $4,441.69
Jupiter JTU1110 S $5,118.11 $5,118.11
Jupiter JTU1140 $3,907.41 $4,046.51
Jupiter JTU1140S $4,650.50 $4,560.50
Jupiter JTU1010 $3,278.39 $3,637.60
Jupiter JTU1010S $4,137.65 $4,120.14
Eastman EB226 $2,741.31 $2,938.00
Eastman EB231 $1,838.40 $1,970.00
Eastman EB231S $2,474.75 $2,554.00
Eastman EB235 NO BID $2,068.00
Eastman EBB431 $3,426.64 $3,570.00
Eastman EBB431S $4,041.99 $4,131.00
Eastman EBB562 $3,834.00 $4,113.00
Eastman EBB534 $3,656.68 $3,920.00
Eastman EBB534S $4,320.92 $4,445.00




SOUSAPHONE + CASE

YSH 411 Series NO BID $5,989.00
Jupiter JSP590 NO BID NO BID
Jupiter JSP1100 $4,280.82 $4,971.45
Jupiter JSP1100S $5,308.38 $6,020.75
Adams MSP1S $7,809.00 $7,809.00
Conn 20KSBW $7,591.02 $7,591.02
Conn 20KW $6,541.02 $6,541.02
Conn 20KSPW $7,591.02 $7,591.02
Eastman EPH324 $3,479.36 $3,628.00
Eastman EPH324S $4,161.81 $4,293.00
King 2350W $5,569.72 $5,569.72
King 2350WSP $6,619.72 $6,619.72
King 2350WSB $6,619.72 $6,619.72
FIELD DRUM

Pearl Philharmonic Mahogany 16x16 PEA-PHX 1616210 $883.00 $883.00
MARIMBA

Adams 4.3 Concert Synthetic w Field Frame ADM-MCKF43 $3,995.00 $3,995.00
Adams Alpha Series 5.0 Octave Voyager Frame $12,659.00 $12,659.00
Yamaha 4.3 Octave Acoustalon w/ multi-frame 1l YMRD2400C NO BID NO BID
Adams - 5.0 University Rosewood Marimba #MAHU50 $12,314.00 $12,314.00
CROTALES

Low Octave (13 notes) ZIL-P0625 w/ mounting bar NO BID $1,603.00
High Octave (13 notes) ZIL-P0615 w/mounting bar NO BID $1,603.00
Low Octave (13 notes) ZIL-P0625 w/o mounting bar NO BID $1,453.00
High Octave (13 notes) ZIL-P0615 w/o mounting bar NO BID $1,453.00




Musser M7360 NO BID NO BID
Yamaha YM-4900A NO BID $8,619.00
TAMBOURINE

Black Swamp 2 7/8" Grenadillo Castanets $115.80 $169.99
Black Swamp 10" Double Row Tambourine - TC1 $159.00 $219.99
Grover 10" Custom Dry Double Row Tambourine - Hybrid Silver NO BID $209.99
VIBRAPHONE

Adams 3 octave Concert Silver Vibraphone w/ Field Frame $4,545.00 $4,545.00
Adams 3 Octave with Field Frame ADM-VCSF30 $3,793.00 $3,793.00
Adams Alpha Vibes $5,021.00 $5,021.00
Adams Artist Classic Vibes NO BID $3,874.00
Adams Concert Series 3/0 Octave Vibraphone with endurance frame $4,545.00 $4,545.00
Adams VCFS30 $3,793.00 $3,793.00
Majestic V1530 Quantum Field Vibraphone $3,485.00 $3,843.75
Marimba One One Vibe 3 Octave Vibraphone A442 NO BID NO BID
Yamaha YV-520 3-Octave NO BID $1,849.00
Yamaha YVT-2700GC Intermediate Tough-Terrain Frame Vibraphone

w/Cover NO BID $5,534.00
YV3710MC NO BID $6,145.00
TIMPANI

Adams Copper Hammered Professional Gen 11 20", 23", 26", 29", &

32" $15,365.00 $15,365.00
Adams Professional Series Generation Il Polished Copper Timpani,

Set of 5 $14,456.00 $16,432.11
Ludwig Grand Symphonic Series Timpani Set with Gauge 23, 26, 29,

32in. $12,067.76 $12,546.22
Ludwig Professional Series Timpani Set Polished Copper Set of 2 (26

and 29") LTP502PG $5,902.71 $5,902.71
Ludwig Professional Series Timpani Set Polished Copper Set of 4 (23-

32") LTP504PG $11,547.20 $11,547.20
Ludwig Professional Series Timpani Set Polished Copper Set of 5 (20-

32") LTP505PG $14,216.47 $14,216.47




Ludwig Standard Series Polished Copper Timpani Set with Gauge 23,

26,29,32in. $10,671.37 $10,671.37
Ludwig Standard Series Fiberglass Timpani Set with Gauge 23, 26, 29,

32in. $8,024.33 $8,024.33
Yamaha Intermediate Series Smooth Copper Timpani Set of 4

(23/26/29/32) NO BID $11,040.00
Yamaha Standard Series Timpani Set of 4 (23",26",29",32") - NO BID $8,358.00
DRUMSET

Pearl MCT Masters Maple PEA-MCT903XP with 20" Bass-Quicksilver

Black $907.00 $1,399.99
Pearl MCT Masters Maple PEA-MCT903XP with 20" Bass-White

Marine Pearl $907.00 $1,399.99
Pearl Export Standard 5 Piece Drum Set $490.00 $979.99
Pearl Roadshow 5 Piece $340.00 $499.00
Ludwig Element Evolution w/ 22" Bass NO BID $799.00
Ludwig Signet 105 Gigabeat 3-piece (Natural Teak) NO BID NO BID
SNARE DRUM

Black Swamp BLA-MS6514MD $814.80 $1,019.00
Black Swamp Multisonic Concert Snare Drum Maple - 14x5 $783.00 $979.00
Grover GRO-G1-6-X NO BID NO BID
Majestic Concert Black 14X6.5 $324.00 $324.00
Pearl Philharmonic PHP1465 $560.00 NO BID
Pearl Philharmonic Walnut 14X6.5 NO BID NO BID
Yamaha YAM-CSM1465A NO BID $392.00
Yamaha YAM-CSM1465A NO BID $392.00
CYMBAL

Dream 22” Bliss Ride $204.52 NO BID
Dream Pang China $147.91 NO BID
Zildjian 8" A Custom Splash Cymbal A20540 NO BID $100.00
Zildjian 8" A Splash Cymbal A0210 NO BID $93.00

BASS DRUM




Adams ADM-ABDS4022 $2,494.00 $2,609.00
Adams Mahogany Concert Bass Drum - 40" x 22" with STBF Field

Frame Suspended Stand $2,609.00 $1,428.50
Pearl 36 x 18 Drum with Stand $1,428.50 $1,438.00
Pearl Concert Bass Drum w/ field suspended stand PBE3618/F46 $1,438.00 $2,486.00
Yamaha 9000 Series Int. with Stand NO BID NO BID
XYLOPHONE

Adams Alpha Xylophone $5,157.00 $5,157.00
Adams Concert Series Xylophone $3,961.00 $3,961.00
Adams 3.5 octave Synthetic Bar Soloist Xylophone $1,983.00 $1,982.75
Yamaha YX-500R NO BID $3,190.00
Musser M-50 $2,742.50 $2,742.50
Majestic 4 Octave Rosewood $3,331.25 $3,331.25
CONCERT ORCHESTRA BELLS (GLOCKENSPIEL)

Adams F5 - D8 NO BID $1,824.00
Adams GAF-33 $4,380.00 $4,380.00
Adams 3.3 Octave Artist Series Glockenspiel Field Frame (GAF33) $4,380.00 $4,380.00
Adams Concert Series 3.3 octave Glockenspiel GCF33 w/ field frame $3,708.00 $3,708.00
Adams Artist Series 3.3 octave Glockenspiel GAT33 $4,017.00 $4,017.00
Fall Creek K100 Glockenspiel NO BID NO BID
Yamaha 2.5 octave YG-1210 NO BID $905.00
ROUND-TOP BELLS

Adams 3.3 Octave Round Top Bells w/Field Frame and Dampener $3,708.00 $4,380.00
SPEAKER

Yamaha CW218V 2x18" Passive Subwoofer, 1220W $575.00 $749.99
Yamaha C215V Dual 15" 2-Passive Speaker, 1000W With Handles $510.95 $679.99

AMPLIFIER




Yamaha PX10 2-Channel Power Amplifier, 2x1200W At 4 Ohm $533.00 $779.99
Roland KC-990 Keyboard Amplifier $713.99 $849.99
Peavey MAX 100 100W 1x10 Bass Combo Amp $153.00 NO BID
DIGITAL PIANO

Clavinova - CVP 701 NO BID NO BID
Korg SP-280 88-Key Digital Piano with Stand $614.86 $699.99
CHIMES

Adams - 1.5 Octave Philharmonic 1.5" Chrome Plated Chimes

#BK5203C $5,659.00 NO BID
Adams 1.5 Octave GEN2 Chimes $3,202.00 $4,203.00
Musser 1.5 Symphonic Chimes Brass $5,008.00 $5,008.00
Deagan DC-9160AC NO BID NO BID
TRAP TABLE

Liberty One Trap Table with Stand NO BID NO BID
PERCUSSSION WORKSTATION

Wenger 147G001 Deluxe Percussion Workstation NO BID NO BID
BOOM STAND

Gibraltar Pro Boom Stand $87.75 NO BID
CONCERT SNARE STAND

Pearl S-1030L Concert Snare Drum Stand $111.00 $127.65
CONCERT TOM STAND

Yamaha WS865A Grand Series double concert tom stand NO BID $126.00
CONCERT GONG STAND

Pageantry Innovations Gong Cart NO BID $982.00
CHIME STAND

Jarvis Chime Stand NO BID NO BID
DOUBLE BASS

Eastman Model 80 and Model 90 $996.84 $1,053.00
Shen NO BID NO BID
Scherl and Roth SR57 $1,280.64 $1,280.64




Scherl and Roth SR68 $2,389.07 $2,389.07
SOUND SYSTEMS
McCormicks Sound System #5000700 NO BID NO BID

Alternate Sound System With Similar Specifications

Alternate Sound System With Similar Specifications

Alternate Sound System With Similar Specifications




